
Girls' 5th-6th Grade Summer Basketball  

July 8th, 2024 

Liberty 26, Storm 14 

 

 

 

 Q1 Q2 Q3 Q4 Final  

Liberty 6 6 12 2 26 

Storm 2 2 6 4 14 

 

 

 

 

Liberty 
26 

Storm 
14 

Eliza Kornacki led for the Liberty in their first 
matchup with 14 points and she grabbed 2 

rebounds and 2 steals 
 

Ava Figliomeni dropped in 8 points, and she 
grabbed 2 rebounds and had an assist 

 
Haylee Pendergast added a bucket, and she 

grabbed a rebound and a steal 
 

Claire Richards also added a bucket, and she 
grabbed 2 rebounds 

 

Kilee Piorkowski was working hard as she 
grabbed 4 rebounds and got an assist 

Danyka Jacobs led for the Storm as she 
dropped 8 points and grabbed 6 rebounds 

and a steal 
 

Sofia Jacobs was working down low as she 
finished with 6 points, 9 rebounds and 2 

steals 
 

Penelope Zoladz was playing tough down low 
as she grabbed 4 rebounds 

 
Norah Castek was working hard as she 

grabbed 2 rebounds and a steal 

 
Courtney Ceckowski played tough defense as 

she grabbed a steal and a rebound 
 

Clara Gilliland was working hard as she 
finished with a rebound  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Girls' 5th-6th Grade Summer Basketball 

July 9th, 2024 

Sky 32, Liberty 30 

 

 

 

 Q1 Q2 Q3 Q4 Final 

Sky 2 10 10 10 32 

Liberty 12 6 4 8 30 

 

 

 

 

Sky 
32 

Liberty 
30 

Alanna Mamot had a big game as she 

finished with 14 points, and she grabbed 6 
rebounds and 4 steals 

 
Khloe Loncar got herself a few buckets for 6 

points and grabbed 7 rebounds and 3 steals 
 
Lucy Shultz also added 6 points and she 

grabbed 3 rebounds and 2 steals 
 

Emari Neal added a bucket, and she grabbed 
6 rebounds and 2 steals 

 
Abigail Blose also added a bucket, and she 

grabbed 7 rebounds, a steal and a block 
 

Olive Barrett also got herself a bucket and 
she grabbed 2 rebounds 

 
Hannah White was playing tough defense as 
she got 2 steals and 2 rebounds 

Ava Figliomeni had a huge performance as 

she had a double-double with 18 points and 
12 rebounds, and got 5 steals, a block and an 

assist 
 

Ella Lavey had two big buckets to get 4 points 
and she grabbed 2 rebounds  
 

Claire Richards also added a couple buckets 
to get 4 points and she grabbed a rebound 

 
Haylee Pendergast added a bucket, and she 

grabbed 4 rebounds and got an assist 
 

Kayleigh Lofft also got herself a bucket and 
she grabbed 5 rebounds 

 
Kilee Piorkowski was working hard as she 

finished with 3 rebounds 
 
 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Girls’ 5th-6th Grade Summer Basketball 

July 9th, 2024 

 

 

 

Players of the Week 

 

 

  
Player of the Week 

Ava Figliomeni 

Liberty 

Unsung Hero 
Lucy Shultz 

Sky 

The Liberty went 1-1 on the day as Ava was 
able to drop 8 points in the first matchup 
they won and grabbed 2 rebounds and an 
assist. Ava was dominant in Liberty’s second 

matchup as she had a double-double with 18 

points and 12 rebounds, while also getting 5 
steals, a block and an assist.   

Lucy had a great performance to help lead the 
Sky in a close game against the Liberty. Lucy 
was getting to the basket as she added 6 
points for the Sky. Lucy also was doing 

whatever she could to help her team on the 

defensive side as she was able to get 3 
rebounds and 2 steals.   



 


